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A heartwarming holiday tale from the author of A YEAR ON LADYBUG FARM

Paul and Derrick have hit their stride with the Hummingbird House Bed and Breakfast, a destination of
distinction in the heart of the Shenandoah Valley. Guests are coming from all over the country to enjoy their
Christmas weekend extravaganza, featuring sleigh rides, champagne suppers, holiday concerts and spa
treatments. Of course there are a few glitches: twenty Christmas trees to be decorated in less than a week, an
absentee massage therapist, and--perhaps most distressing of all-- the unexpected presence of three school-
age children in the Hummingbird House, courtesy of their saucy young housekeeper Purline.

While Purline tries to teach her children, as well as her bosses, the true meaning of Christmas, the lost and
the lonely-- often disguised as the wealthy and the privileged-- are drawn to the Hummingbird House.
Among them are:

The author of a famous book on miracles who has lost his faith A family secretly on the verge of disaster A
husband and wife facing their last Christmas together

With the help of a Harley-riding stranger, a series of unexpected events, and the innocent good intentions of
their hosts, healing comes to the wounded and miracles unfold, proving once again that at the Hummingbird
House you may not always find what you expect, but you’ll always find what you need.

“Full of comedy and sentiment”
--Kirkus reviews on THE HUMMINGBIRD HOUSE
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From reader reviews:

Karole Standley:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive currently,
people have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
by simply surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated it for a while is reading.
Yeah, by reading a book your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand up than other is high.
To suit your needs who want to start reading a book, we give you this Christmas at The Hummingbird House
(Volume 2) book as beginner and daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Linda Brown:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information these days can get by anyone at
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is in the former life are hard to be find than now is taking
seriously which one is acceptable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you understand it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Christmas at The Hummingbird House (Volume 2)
as your daily resource information.

Rose Miller:

Are you kind of hectic person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind ability
or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book in
comparison with can satisfy your short space of time to read it because this all time you only find reserve
that need more time to be go through. Christmas at The Hummingbird House (Volume 2) can be your answer
because it can be read by a person who have those short time problems.

Ronald Folk:

Reading a book to become new life style in this calendar year; every people loves to examine a book. When
you go through a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend
on what types of book that you have read. If you would like get information about your examine, you can
read education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this sort
of us novel, comics, and soon. The Christmas at The Hummingbird House (Volume 2) provide you with new
experience in examining a book.
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