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Jean-Pierre Dupuy, prophet of what he calls "enlightened doomsaying," has long warned that modern society
is on a path to self-destruction. In this book, he pleads for a subversion of this crisis from within, arguing that
it is our lopsided view of religion and reason that has set us on this course. In denial of our sacred origins and
hubristically convinced of the powers of human reason, we cease to know our own limits: our disenchanted
world leaves us defenseless against a headlong rush into the abyss of global warming, nuclear holocaust, and
the other catastrophes that loom on our horizon. Reviving the religious anthropology of Max Weber, Emile
Durkheim, and Marcel Mauss and in dialogue with the work of René Girard, Dupuy shows that we must
remember the world's sacredness in order to keep human violence in check. A metaphysical and theological
detective, he tracks the sacred in the very fields where human reason considers itself most free from
everything it judges irrational: science, technology, economics, political and strategic thought. In making
such claims, The Mark of the Sacred  takes on religion bashers, secularists, and fundamentalists at once.
Written by one of the deepest and most versatile thinkers of our time, it militates for a world where reason is
no longer an enemy of faith.
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From reader reviews:

Corrine Switzer:

Do you among people who can't read enjoyable if the sentence chained within the straightway, hold on guys
that aren't like that. This The Mark of the Sacred (Cultural Memory in the Present) book is readable by
means of you who hate those perfect word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable
reading through experience without leaving perhaps decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The
writer associated with The Mark of the Sacred (Cultural Memory in the Present) content conveys thinking
easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the content but it just
different such as it. So , do you nonetheless thinking The Mark of the Sacred (Cultural Memory in the
Present) is not loveable to be your top list reading book?

Kathleen Elder:

This The Mark of the Sacred (Cultural Memory in the Present) tend to be reliable for you who want to
become a successful person, why. The key reason why of this The Mark of the Sacred (Cultural Memory in
the Present) can be one of many great books you must have is giving you more than just simple reading food
but feed you with information that might be will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is handy, you
can bring it all over the place and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed ones. Beside that this The
Mark of the Sacred (Cultural Memory in the Present) forcing you to have an enormous of experience for
instance rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day exercise.
So , let's have it and luxuriate in reading.

Elmer August:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them family or
their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, or even playing
video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look different you can
read a book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read you can spent the entire day
to reading a reserve. The book The Mark of the Sacred (Cultural Memory in the Present) it is extremely good
to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These were enjoying reading this book.
Should you did not have enough space to develop this book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore
simply to read this book from your smart phone. The price is not to fund but this book possesses high
quality.

Randal Gore:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but
additionally native or citizen want book to know the upgrade information of year to be able to year. As we
know those ebooks have many advantages. Beside all of us add our knowledge, may also bring us to around
the world. With the book The Mark of the Sacred (Cultural Memory in the Present) we can consider more



advantage. Don't someone to be creative people? To become creative person must prefer to read a book.
Simply choose the best book that suitable with your aim. Don't be doubt to change your life at this book The
Mark of the Sacred (Cultural Memory in the Present). You can more attractive than now.
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