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New York Times bestselling author Sarah MacLean has taken the world of historical romance fiction by
storm!  With A Rogue by Any Other Name, she once again boldly breaks new ground. 

The first book in her remarkably fresh and original Fallen Angels series—featuring four dark Regency Era
heroes who will steal the hearts of their heroines and the readers alike—A Rogue will captivate fans of Julia
Quinn and Suzanne Enoch while bringing new romance readers eagerly into the fold. The scintillating story
of a disgraced Marquess reduced to running a London gambling hall who hopes to restore his good fortune
by marrying a very proper lady who’s secretly drawn to sin, A Rogue by Any Other Name is sexy and wicked
fun.
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From reader reviews:

Brandi Cardoza:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important work, like looking
for your favorite e-book and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled A Rogue by Any Other Name: The First Rule of Scoundrels (Rules of
Scoundrels). Try to face the book A Rogue by Any Other Name: The First Rule of Scoundrels (Rules of
Scoundrels) as your pal. It means that it can for being your friend when you experience alone and beside
those of course make you smarter than ever. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you. The book makes you more
confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let us make new experience along with
knowledge with this book.

Alberta Jones:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading habit give you lot
of advantages. The advantages you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the book in
which improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of guide you read, if
you want have more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want truly feel happy
read one together with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The actual A Rogue by Any Other
Name: The First Rule of Scoundrels (Rules of Scoundrels) is kind of guide which is giving the reader erratic
experience.

Mark Bock:

This A Rogue by Any Other Name: The First Rule of Scoundrels (Rules of Scoundrels) tend to be reliable
for you who want to be a successful person, why. The main reason of this A Rogue by Any Other Name: The
First Rule of Scoundrels (Rules of Scoundrels) can be one of several great books you must have is usually
giving you more than just simple examining food but feed you with information that probably will shock
your before knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it almost everywhere and whenever your
conditions both in e-book and printed types. Beside that this A Rogue by Any Other Name: The First Rule of
Scoundrels (Rules of Scoundrels) forcing you to have an enormous of experience for instance rich
vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day activity. So , let's
have it appreciate reading.

Latoya Jones:

The actual book A Rogue by Any Other Name: The First Rule of Scoundrels (Rules of Scoundrels) will
bring that you the new experience of reading any book. The author style to clarify the idea is very unique. In
case you try to find new book to read, this book very appropriate to you. The book A Rogue by Any Other
Name: The First Rule of Scoundrels (Rules of Scoundrels) is much recommended to you to study. You can
also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can more easily to read the book.
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