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The first great modern migration of the Jewish people, from the Old World to America, has been often and
expertly chronicled, but until now the second great wave of Jewish migration has been overlooked. After
World War II, spurred by a postwar economic boom, American Jews sought new beginnings in the nation's
South and West. Thousands abandoned their previous homes in the urban, industrial centers of the North and
moved to Miami and Los Angeles seeking warmth, opportunity, and ultimately a new Jewish community -
one unlike any they had ever known. This move turned out to be as significant as their ancestors' departure
from their traditional worlds. Earlier Jewish immigrants to the New World had sought to fit into the well-
established communities they found in the North, but Miami and L.A. were frontier towns with few rules for
newcomers. Jews could establish new economic niches in the hotel and real estate industries, and build new
schools, political organizations, and community centers to reshape the cities' ethnic landscapes. Drawing
upon rich and extensive research, historian Deborah Dash Moore traces the evolution of a new consensus on
the boundaries of Jewish life and what it means to be Jewish. In Miami, this consensus took shape through
the struggles to define a community in the face of Christian anti-Semitism. In L.A., Jews were compelled to
define their religious and political identities while pressure from HUAC hearings labeled many as
communists. Both communities, spurred by the model of the strong, autonomous Jew emerging from the new
state of Israel, fought restricted beaches and Christian prayer in schools and made their political presence
known. Today these sun-soaked,entrepreneurial communities have become part of a truly American, self-
confident style of Judaism. Most American Jews have families or friends who have chosen to live in these
urban paradises. Many others have visited or vacationed under their palm trees. Now the vibrant Jewish cul
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From reader reviews:

France Brown:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing for us
to find out everything in the world. Each book has different aim as well as goal; it means that reserve has
different type. Some people really feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. They can be reading
whatever they consider because their hobby is usually reading a book. Why not the person who don't like
reading a book? Sometime, person feel need book after they found difficult problem or exercise. Well,
probably you will want this To the Golden Cities: Pursuing the American Jewish Dream in Miami and L.A..

Pat Clark:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider when those information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one works to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you find the unstable
resource then you get it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen with you if you take To the Golden Cities: Pursuing the American Jewish
Dream in Miami and L.A. as the daily resource information.

Lisa Alaniz:

Reading a book to be new life style in this season; every people loves to read a book. When you study a book
you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read guides, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what forms of
book that you have read. If you would like get information about your study, you can read education books,
but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel, comics,
as well as soon. The To the Golden Cities: Pursuing the American Jewish Dream in Miami and L.A. provide
you with a new experience in examining a book.

Charles Whittaker:

In this era which is the greater man or woman or who has ability in doing something more are more precious
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you must
do is just spending your time not much but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of several
books in the top record in your reading list is actually To the Golden Cities: Pursuing the American Jewish
Dream in Miami and L.A.. This book that is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in turning
out to be precious person. By looking up and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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