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'The Andes - A Guide for Climbers' is the only comprehensive guidebook to the peaks of the Andes.

This is the 4th English edition of the only comprehensive climbing guidebook to the peaks of the Andes. It
covers many areas not described in any other source. This new edition has expanded coverage of the whole
range, with many new photos and route diagrams plus extended coverage of the ski-mountaineering
opportunities in the Andes.The book contains details of how to climb all 100 of the major 6000m peaks in
the Andes, plus route information for approximately 300 other peaks. There are over 240 route diagrams, 150
additional photos and 80 sketch maps.

Because an unforgettable journey starts with a thorough preparation, find out everything you need to
know about climbing the Puna de Atacama in this guide

ABOUT THE AUTHOR

The author John Biggar is a professional mountaineering instructor based in Castle Douglas,
Kirkcudbrightshire, Scotland. His first publication was an internal report for the nuclear physics department
at Edinburgh University, entitled "Anisotropies in the Sequential Break-up of Li6". Since those days John
has done little nuclear physics but has been climbing and ski-mountaineering in the Andes a lot. He has
climbed many of the highest peaks, including 19 of the 20 highest, made over 100 ascents of 6000m peaks,
plus 180 ascents of Andean 5000m peaks. He has made first ascents of six 6000m peaks and also made the
first ski descent of Domuyo, the highest peak in Patagonia. A professional mountaineering instructor, he runs
a business which specialises in mountaineering, skiing and ski-mountaineering expeditions to South
America.
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From reader reviews:

William Prentice:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
skill or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book compared
to can satisfy your short time to read it because this time you only find e-book that need more time to be
read. Puna de Atacama: The Andes, a Guide For Climbers can be your answer since it can be read by an
individual who have those short extra time problems.

John Newton:

In this particular era which is the greater individual or who has ability in doing something more are more
special than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you must do
is just spending your time little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of many books in the
top checklist in your reading list is Puna de Atacama: The Andes, a Guide For Climbers. This book that is
certainly qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in turning out to be precious person. By looking
upwards and review this guide you can get many advantages.

Victoria Owen:

A lot of guide has printed but it differs. You can get it by web on social media. You can choose the very best
book for you, science, amusing, novel, or whatever by means of searching from it. It is called of book Puna
de Atacama: The Andes, a Guide For Climbers. You'll be able to your knowledge by it. Without leaving the
printed book, it might add your knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most essential that, you
must aware about book. It can bring you from one spot to other place.

Nancy Ochoa:

A number of people said that they feel bored when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half parts of the book. You can choose often the book Puna de Atacama: The Andes, a Guide
For Climbers to make your current reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading proficiency is developing
when you similar to reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to learn it and mingle the sensation
about book and looking at especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to start a book and read it. Beside
that the publication Puna de Atacama: The Andes, a Guide For Climbers can to be your friend when you're
truly feel alone and confuse using what must you're doing of this time.
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