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The first known Chicago Tribune theater review appeared on March 25, 1853. An anonymous notice, it
shared the page with two other announcements—one about a pair of thousand-pound hogs set to be
slaughtered and another trumpeting the largest load of lumber ever to leave Chicago. “And thus Chicago’s
priorities were starkly laid out right there on that page,” begins Chris Jones in the introduction to this
eyewitness cultural history. “Hog butcher for the world and windy self-promoter, specializing in commerce-
driven superlatives. The arts came a poor third. Critics, and the artists they covered, would rail against that
perceived set of civic priorities for years.”

The Chicago of today, on the other hand, is regarded as one of the world’s premier cities for theater, and no
one has had a more consistent front-row seat to its ascendance than the Chicago Tribune theater
critics. Bigger, Brighter, Louder weaves together more than 150 years of Tribune reviews into a compelling
narrative, pairing full reviews with commentary and history. With a sharp eye for telling details and a keen
sense of historical context, Jones, longtime chief Tribune theater critic, takes readers through decades of
highs and lows, successes and failures.

The book showcases fascinating early reviews of actors and shows that would go on to achieve phenomenal
success, including a tryout of A Raisin in the Sun with newcomer Sidney Poitier and the first major review
of The Producers.  It also delves into the rare and the unusual, such as a previously unpublished Tennessee
Williams interview and a long conversation with Edward Albee’s mother. With reviews from Claudia
Cassidy, Peregine Pickle, William Leonard, and more, many never collected before, Bigger, Brighter,
Louder offers a unique lasting record of an ephemeral art and a riveting look at the history behind Chicago’s
rise to theatrical greatness.
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From reader reviews:

Ronald Brun:

What do you think of book? It is just for students since they are still students or it for all people in the world,
what the best subject for that? Only you can be answered for that question above. Every person has several
personality and hobby for every single other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that they don't
wish do that. You must know how great and also important the book Bigger, Brighter, Louder: 150 Years of
Chicago Theater as Seen by "Chicago Tribune" Critics. All type of book could you see on many sources.
You can look for the internet solutions or other social media.

Earl Goodman:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the extra time or they
will get large amount of stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have extra time, we
will say absolutely yes. People is human not really a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do
you possess when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer may unlimited right. Then
do you try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, typically the
book you have read is definitely Bigger, Brighter, Louder: 150 Years of Chicago Theater as Seen by
"Chicago Tribune" Critics.

Gena Colgan:

In this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more special than other.
Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you need to do is
just spending your time very little but quite enough to enjoy a look at some books. One of the books in the
top checklist in your reading list is Bigger, Brighter, Louder: 150 Years of Chicago Theater as Seen by
"Chicago Tribune" Critics. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Hills can get you closer in getting
precious person. By looking way up and review this book you can get many advantages.

Clarence Cobb:

Some individuals said that they feel weary when they reading a e-book. They are directly felt that when they
get a half parts of the book. You can choose often the book Bigger, Brighter, Louder: 150 Years of Chicago
Theater as Seen by "Chicago Tribune" Critics to make your current reading is interesting. Your own skill of
reading expertise is developing when you similar to reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy
you just read it and mingle the idea about book and reading especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like
to start a book and study it. Beside that the book Bigger, Brighter, Louder: 150 Years of Chicago Theater as
Seen by "Chicago Tribune" Critics can to be your friend when you're experience alone and confuse in doing
what must you're doing of their time.
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