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This beguiling tale of a scandalous ménage à trois among England’s upper classes is a high society love story
that combines memoir and biography into a fascinating, heady read in the vein of The Bolter and Portrait of
a Marriage.

Among the glittering stars of British society, Sofka Zinovieff’s grandparents lived and loved with abandon.
Robert Heber-Percy was a dashing young man who would rather have a drink than open a book, so his
involvement with Jennifer Fry, a beautiful socialite famous for her style and charm, was not surprising. But
by the time Robert met and married Jennifer, he had already been involved with a man—Gerald, Lord
Berners—for more than a decade.

Stout, eccentric, and significantly older, Gerald was a well-known composer, and at home among scholars.
He also owned one of Britain’s loveliest stately homes, Faringdon House in Oxfordshire. The two made an
unlikely couple, especially because they lived together at Faringdon House when homosexuality was illegal.
And then a pregnant Jennifer moved into Faringdon in 1942, creating a formidable ménage à trois.

In this gorgeous, entertaining narrative of bohemian aristocracy illustrated with dozens of photographs,
Sofka Zinovieff probes the mysteries of her grandparents and the third man in their marriage. Who was
Gerald, and what brought Robert and Jennifer together under his roof? Why did Jennifer marry Robert?
Piecing together the complicated reality behind the scandals of revelry and sexuality, she finally allows old
ghosts to rest.
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From reader reviews:

Michael Short:

As people who live in often the modest era should be change about what going on or facts even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era that is certainly always change and progress. Some of you maybe can
update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice in your case but the problems coming to you
actually is you don't know what one you should start with. This The Mad Boy, Lord Berners, My
Grandmother and Me: An Aristocratic Family, a High-Society Scandal and an Extraordinary Legacy is our
recommendation to help you keep up with the world. Why, because book serves what you want and want in
this era.

Joseph Benoit:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world adores. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new
details. When you read a guide you will get new information simply because book is one of various ways to
share the information as well as their idea. Second, examining a book will make you actually more
imaginative. When you examining a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring someone to
imagine the story how the characters do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to other
individuals. When you read this The Mad Boy, Lord Berners, My Grandmother and Me: An Aristocratic
Family, a High-Society Scandal and an Extraordinary Legacy, you can tells your family, friends along with
soon about yours guide. Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a guide.

John Hawkins:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't ascertain book by its deal with may
doesn't work here is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not because fantastic as in the
outside appearance likes. Maybe you answer may be The Mad Boy, Lord Berners, My Grandmother and Me:
An Aristocratic Family, a High-Society Scandal and an Extraordinary Legacy why because the amazing
cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint you actually. The inside or
content is usually fantastic as the outside as well as cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly show you to
pick up this book.

Danica Johnson:

You can spend your free time to see this book this publication. This The Mad Boy, Lord Berners, My
Grandmother and Me: An Aristocratic Family, a High-Society Scandal and an Extraordinary Legacy is
simple to develop you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not have
much space to bring often the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you much easier to
read it. You can save the particular book in your smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will



get when you buy this book.
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